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My Dear Friends, 
 
Greetings in Jesus’ wonderful Name. 
 
Already we are half way through the year with so much 
change politically, climate wise and in the Body of 
Christ.  The war in Europe is now in its fifth month with no 
sign of letting up, and we face economic changes.  We 
continue our work of sowing the good seed of God’s word 
in all kinds of challenging conditions and the Lord assures 
us of His favour, blessing and increase.  Jesus is still our 
source and our provider. 
 
In April my family celebrated in style my sister Mary and 
my birthdays.  Both North and South Islanders were     
present in Auckland, and then, as a complete surprise to 

us, our sister Lily (and her husband Bob) from Vancouver, 
Canada, walked into the party.  It was all amazing and well 
done as they worked together in spite of one couple being 
struck with Covid.  “God will make a way when there 
seems to be no way“ as the songwriter wrote.  I thank the 
Lord for family.  It’s His idea.  (Psalm 68:6)  
 
News from Andra Pradesh is that Johney and Juni have 
reached out with VBS all day retreats to thousands of kids 
this very hot Indian summer.  It is an excellent program 
which the parents want their children to attend and the 
kids love it.  Planting the good seed of the Word of God in 
the hearts of the young is a privilege and has always been 

what this ministry has been about.  Of India’s billion plus 
people, half are children under 18 years.  We are giving 
some of them a hope and a future, while growing up in a 
chaotic world. 
 
Thank you for continuing in prayer and generous support 
for these outreaches.  Abraham Lincoln said:  “A child is a 
person who is going to carry on what you have started.  
He will assume control of your cities, states and          
corporations.  The fate of humanity is in his hands.”  So, 
let us reach more children together.  This great work can 
only be done by a team of loving, dedicated people.  As 
the song goes, “Jesus loves the little children, all the   
children of the world.”  Jesus said:  “I thank you, Father, 
Lord of heaven and earth, that you have hidden these 
things from the wise and prudent and have revealed them 
to babes.”  (Matthew 11:25) 
 
May the Lord bless you and your family, meeting all your 
needs, giving you strength and wisdom.  He is the miracle 
worker. 
 
With Loving Appreciation, 
 
 

July/August 
2022 

Anbu and Ebby sharing with the people in Gobi 

Nancy, Lily, & Mary 



Pastor Johney (Kakinada, A.P.) reports... 
 
Our VBS children’s programs ran from May to July 4th  
during a very hot summer.  The Lord enabled us to reach 
2300 children as we traveled to 13 churches.  Many     
children made decisions to live for Christ and be baptized.    
We praise God for the fruitful ministry He has given us. 
 
Our pastors training program which began in January, is 
going well with combined teaching and evangelism.     

These ten students are doing very well, and we need    
resources to help them complete the course. 

Thank you for your prayers and support for Upada church 
building extension in the Fishermen’s Village.  We are still 
in need of finances to finish the work. 
 
Thank you for your prayers and support for our growing 
work.  We are praying for you. 

 

Donations can be made by direct credit to Global Nulife Ministries  

ASB Bank A/c No.   12-3072-0380376-01 

Please remember to include your name and designation of funds 

Ps. Shamaganda grateful for new motorbike 

 
 

 

  Please contact admin@globalnulife.org if you wish 

to receive newsletter by e-mail.  Phone: 07 571 1244  

Pastors in training program 

Opportunities for Giving... 
 

 Upada village church extension (Johney)…any donation 

 Yenada village outreach (Samuel John)…any donation 

 Support for ten pastors in training…$50 each monthly 
($500)  

 Clean drinkable water - wells and filters...$600 to $1000 

 Bangalore slum ministry (Scott)…$50 monthly or any 
donation 

 Destitute marginalized people (lepers, disabled, 
blind)...any donation 

 Children’s summer VBS programs…any donation 

 Neglected children’s special needs...$15 each (200   
children) 

 Bibles and Christian literature…$10 each or any        
donation 

Church building in the Fishermen’s Village 

A Summer VBS program 

A child from a slum 


